Town of New Duiham
2016 Paving Bid Results

FR Carroll Brox Industries RD Paving Pike Industries |Advanced
Machine Method $56.40/ton $68.50/ton $65.69/ton $65.45/ton $58.90/ton
Hand Work $100/ton $145/ton $118/ton $150/ton $125/ton
Cold Planing $7.00/sqyd  |$5.00/sq yd $2.48/If joints  |S$13/sq yd $5/sq yd
Hot Mix S60/ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shoulder Work S.50/If $.83/If S.42/If S.50/If $1.10/If
Total Project Cost S 250,103.54 $344,111.40 $312,997.91 $329,685.75| $353,234.50
Ammended (est. hand
work, Cold Planning, $285,068.54
Insurance X X
Bid Bond X X X X X

Notes- FR Carroll Bid

Machine Method only with Tack.




